SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALENO: SBS-16-09
Bid Opening Date: 12/9/15

LOT 1: Hyd Press, 3000 psi
LOT 2: Sec Booths, 4
LOT 3: Job Boxes, 4

LOT 6: Utility trailers NRR
LOT 7: Mix Pots, 2
LOT 8: Water Trailer NRR

LOT 11: Bicycles, 84
LOT 12: Flail Mowers, 2
LOT 13: Pallet Racks

10:00 am LOT 4: Ce, Cit Equip, Diesel LOT 9: Transportainers, 2
LOT 5: Tar Pot/Oiler LOT 10: Transportainer, 1

No. Bidder's Name LOT 1 LOT 2 LOT 3 LOT 4 LOT5 LOT 6 LOT 7 LOT 8 LOT 9 LOT 10 LOT 11 LOT 12 LOT 13
1 |Clete Hillseth 3,617.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 2,607.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 416.00 No Bid
2 |Mark Lonczak 877.79 No Bid No Bid| 2,377.79 No Bid No Bid 377.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 87.79
3 [Robert Jeffers No Bid No Bid 427.00 102.00 27.00 745.00 102.00 545.00 565.00 565.00 184.00 157.00 30.00
4 |Steve Heller 7,000.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 |Ronald Baken No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 |Mario Facchin No Bid No Bid 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 [Joachim Wiest No Bid No Bid 223.00 866.00 No Bid 26.00 36.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 106.00 266.00 26.00
8 |Noel Sewall No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 |Gary Collier No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 [Richard Myeres No Bid No Bid| 1,200.00| 3,025.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00
11 |Carl Bruns No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 415.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Charles Williamson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 1,380.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 [Rich Moore No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |Joe Satariano No Bid No Bid No Bid 376.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.00 No Bid
15 |Kirk Campbell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 |Don Perry No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 |Mario Marcon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 500.00 No Bid
18 |John Seruin No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 |Neil Porter No Bid No Bid 201.00 76.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 325.00 No Bid 675.00 No Bid 126.00 176.00
20 [Greg Jeppson No Bid No Bid 47.50 327.50 No Bid 692.50 42.00 328.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |Arnold Hof 386.00 56.00 218.00| 7,128.00 96.00f 1,142.00 276.00 1,621.00 No Bid No Bid 172.00 162.00 312.00
22 |Armando Martinez No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 80.00
23 |Chris Kinsella No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 1,003.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:
Bid Opening Date: 12/9/15

SBS-16-09

LOT 14: Bore Mach & bits
LOT 15: Pallet Racks
LOT 16: Chain Link Fabric

LOT 19: Air Comp, 3 tank, 1

LOT 20: Tractor Attach
LOT 21: Barrel Tilters, 2

LOT 24: Bleachers, 2
LOT 25: Metal Steps, 2
LOT 26: Misc. Metal

10:00 am LOT 17: Truck Access LOT 22: Pressure Wash Equip, 4
LOT 18: Pallet Racks LOT 23: Misc Build Matl, 14 plt

No. Bidder's Name LOT 14 LOT 15 LOT 16: LOT 17: LOT 18: LOT 19: LOT 20: LOT 21: LOT 22: LOT 23: LOT 24 LOT 25 LOT 26
1 |Clete Hillseth No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 [Mark Lonczak 177.79 87.79 No Bid No Bid 67.79 No Bid No Bid 177.79 477.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |Robert Jeffers 311.00 30.00 211.00 211.00 21.00 121.00 224.00 No Bid 121.00 No Bid 161.00 157.00 426.00
4 |Steve Heller No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 |Ronald Baken No Bid 365.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 [Mario Facchin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 |Joachim Wiest 333.00 31.00 31.00 66.00 36.00 88.00 733.00 85.00 121.00 53.00 28.00 No Bid 66.00
8 |Noel Sewall No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.00
9 |Gary Collier No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |Richard Myeres 75.00 100.00 400.00 375.00 No Bid 550.00| 1,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 [Carl Bruns No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Charles Williamson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 75.00 No Bid
13 |Rich Moore No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00
14 |Joe Satariano 152.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 167.00 101.52 No Bid
15 |Kirk Campbell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 201.00 No Bid
16 |Don Perry No Bid 212.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 |Mario Marcon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 [John Seruin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 |Neil Porter 155.00 125.00 155.00 No Bid 95.00 176.00 598.00 No Bid 179.00 No Bid 55.00 No Bid 526.00
20 [Greg Jeppson 107.00 40.00 42.00 87.00 82.00 12.00 127.01 No Bid 422.00 No Bid No Bid 167.00 101.52
21 |Arnold Hof 162.00 164.00 294.00 41.00 132.00 561.00| 2,802.00 42.00 396.00 212.00 236.00 15.00 2,164.00
22 |Armando Martinez No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 [Chris Kinsella No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




	SBS-09-03

