
SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-13 LOT 1: Hog Feeders, 2 LOT 6: Truck Equip LOT 11: Portable Air Comp, 3
Bid Opening Date: June 8, 2016 LOT 2: Bicycles, 23 LOT 7: Elec Lifts, 4 LOT 12: Floor Clean Equip, 3, misc

LOT 3: Pumps, 9 plt, 1 crt LOT 8: Pallet Jacks, 5 LOT 13: Misc Carts, 9

 10:00 am LOT 4: Camper Shell LOT 9: Tables, 7

LOT 5: Lifts, 4, 1K cap LOT 10: Cement Utility Px, 6 plt

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 1 LOT 2 LOT 3 LOT 4 LOT 5 LOT 6 LOT 7 LOT 8 LOT 9 LOT 10 LOT 11 LOT 12 LOT 13  

1 Sam Pechin No Bid 500.00 1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 John Bodo No Bid 451.00 2,626.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 326.00 No Bid

3 Robert Jeffers 111.00 No Bid 7.00 No Bid 45.00 337.00 211.00 211.00 57.00 25.00 47.00 No Bid 131.00

4 Joachim Wiest No Bid 100.00 1,607.00 No Bid 666.00 135.00 475.00 111.00 312.00 No Bid 106.00 103.00 35.00

5 Claude Bennett No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Rex Evatt 108.00 88.00 388.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 675.00 118.00 No Bid 168.00 No Bid No Bid 198.00

7 Joe Morgan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.00 No Bid No Bid 166.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 177.00

8 Don Cooper 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid 120.00 No Bid 75.00 100.00 No Bid No Bid

9 Steven Biehl 252.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Noel Sewall No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 259.00 No Bid

11 Tom Illingworth 300.00 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid 100.00

12 Brent Budden No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 277.00 No Bid No Bid 237.00 No Bid No Bid

13 Michael Bercovich No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00 420.00 No Bid No Bid

14 Clinton Stewart No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 147.01 147.01 No Bid 101.01 76.01 No Bid 66.01 No Bid 266.01

15 James Vidal No Bid No Bid 2,017.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 Henri Suermondt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 215.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Greg Jeppson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.50 No Bid 27.52

18 Mario Marcon No Bid No Bid 2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.00 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.00

19 Mike Jackson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-13 LOT 1: Hog Feeders, 2 LOT 6: Truck Equip LOT 11: Portable Air Comp, 3
Bid Opening Date: June 8, 2016 LOT 2: Bicycles, 23 LOT 7: Elec Lifts, 4 LOT 12: Floor Clean Equip, 3, misc

LOT 3: Pumps, 9 plt, 1 crt LOT 8: Pallet Jacks, 5 LOT 13: Misc Carts, 9

 10:00 am LOT 4: Camper Shell LOT 9: Tables, 7

LOT 5: Lifts, 4, 1K cap LOT 10: Cement Utility Px, 6 plt

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 1 LOT 2 LOT 3 LOT 4 LOT 5 LOT 6 LOT 7 LOT 8 LOT 9 LOT 10 LOT 11 LOT 12 LOT 13  

27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-13 LOT 14: Hog Feeders, 2 LOT 19: Glass Shapes, 8 plt LOT 24: Transportainer, 7X8X8'

Bid Opening Date: June 8, 2016 LOT 15: Platform & Stairs, Aluminum LOT 20: Generator, Diesel, Kohler 175RO771 LOT 25: Misc Pipe Fittings, 8 plt

LOT 16: Security Booths, 4 LOT 21: A/C Units, 0, Carrier 50JS-048-601 LOT 26: Transportainer, 8X8X20'

 10:00 am LOT 17: Oven, Grieve AB-500 LOT 22: Metal Shed, 13X7X8'

LOT 18: Mixers, 2, 20-1160V LOT 23: Guard Type Shack, 6X6X8'

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 14 LOT 15 LOT 16:  LOT 17: LOT 18: LOT 19: LOT 20: LOT 21: LOT 22: LOT 23: LOT 24  LOT 25  LOT 26

1 Sam Pechin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 John Bodo No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,601.00 3,601.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Robert Jeffers 47.00 25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00 No Bid 31.00 271.00 No Bid

4 Joachim Wiest No Bid 101.00 No Bid No Bid 2.00 666.00 388.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 101.00 No Bid

5 Claude Bennett No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 637.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Rex Evatt 108.00 268.00 128.00 168.00 168.00 No Bid 888.00 508.00 No Bid 188.00 288.00 288.00 328.00

7 Joe Morgan No Bid 111.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 86.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Don Cooper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 801.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 50.00 No Bid

9 Steven Biehl 126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Noel Sewall No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 Tom Illingworth 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 100.00 100.00 450.00

12 Brent Budden No Bid No Bid 267.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 357.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

13 Michael Bercovich No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 Clinton Stewart No Bid No Bid No Bid 161.01 No Bid No Bid 326.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 36.01 101.01

15 James Vidal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 Henri Suermondt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Greg Jeppson No Bid 273.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.52

18 Mario Marcon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Mike Jackson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid 600.00

20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-13 LOT 14: Hog Feeders, 2 LOT 19: Glass Shapes, 8 plt LOT 24: Transportainer, 7X8X8'

Bid Opening Date: June 8, 2016 LOT 15: Platform & Stairs, Aluminum LOT 20: Generator, Diesel, Kohler 175RO771 LOT 25: Misc Pipe Fittings, 8 plt

LOT 16: Security Booths, 4 LOT 21: A/C Units, 0, Carrier 50JS-048-601 LOT 26: Transportainer, 8X8X20'

 10:00 am LOT 17: Oven, Grieve AB-500 LOT 22: Metal Shed, 13X7X8'

LOT 18: Mixers, 2, 20-1160V LOT 23: Guard Type Shack, 6X6X8'

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 14 LOT 15 LOT 16:  LOT 17: LOT 18: LOT 19: LOT 20: LOT 21: LOT 22: LOT 23: LOT 24  LOT 25  LOT 26

27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received, verified all entries on this abstract from those bids and find it correct.

Sales Manager: Date:

Witness to Bid Opening: Date:


