
SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-16     LOT 1: Misc Test Equip, 8 pl, 1 ch, 1 crt LOT 6: Band Saw, WT 3321 LOT 11: Hoist Test Stand, 12T
Bid Opening Date: 8/10/16 LOT 2: Machinist Cab, 2 LOT 7: Drill Press & Shear LOT 12: Lifts, 2, Geni

LOT 3: Lift Tables, 2 LOT 8: Band Saw, Arm. 8M8S1 LOT 13: Paint Mixer RD 5500

 10:00 am LOT 4: Laminator, 1, Infl Cus sys LOT 9: Mach Cab, 4

LOT 5: Drill Press, WT 100 LOT 10: Drill Press, Johansson

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 1 LOT 2 LOT 3 LOT 4 LOT 5 LOT 6 LOT 7 LOT 8 LOT 9 LOT 10 LOT 11 LOT 12 LOT 13  

1 Guy Ruchonnet No Bid 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Steven Biehl No Bid No Bid 226.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 511.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 352.00 No Bid

3 Matt Swisher No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Jeff Lee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 907.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Arnold Hof No Bid 218.00 136.00 No Bid 110.00 158.00 146.00 781.00 282.00 1,086.00 120.00 428.00 No Bid

6 Phil Sage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 250.00 450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Dan Sachau No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Earl Kelly No Bid 78.76 No Bid No Bid 288.83 293.67 728.96 No Bid 308.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 Tom Lipton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,856.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 John Patton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 Kevin Hendershott No Bid No Bid 91.00 No Bid 183.00 No Bid 46.00 No Bid No Bid 731.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 Joachim Wiest 888.00 No Bid 51.00 51.00 181.00 121.00 202.00 131.00 22.00 222.00 10.00 51.00 10.00

13 Gary Aslin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 James Vidal 11,537.00 No Bid No Bid 567.00 No Bid No Bid 157.00 No Bid No Bid 367.00 No Bid No Bid 37.00

15 Joe Morgan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 177.00 410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 Neil Porter No Bid 26.00 56.00 105.00 105.00 176.00 205.00 No Bid 125.00 795.00 55.00 255.00 55.00

17 Andrew Barreto 9,375.00 No Bid No Bid 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

18 Brandt Esser No Bid 226.00 No Bid No Bid 226.00 276.00 No Bid No Bid 311.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Chris Burns No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 577.00 777.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Stan Carter 76.00 15.00 10.01 22.10 72.00 76.00 141.50 201.51 21.00 71.42 15.00 51.00 1.21

21 Lou Ramondetta No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

22 Michael Bercovich No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Nick St. Hilaire No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 Dean Felzkdwski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 Paul Berson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 526.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

26 John Schiff 415.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-16     LOT 1: Misc Test Equip, 8 pl, 1 ch, 1 crt LOT 6: Band Saw, WT 3321 LOT 11: Hoist Test Stand, 12T
Bid Opening Date: 8/10/16 LOT 2: Machinist Cab, 2 LOT 7: Drill Press & Shear LOT 12: Lifts, 2, Geni

LOT 3: Lift Tables, 2 LOT 8: Band Saw, Arm. 8M8S1 LOT 13: Paint Mixer RD 5500

 10:00 am LOT 4: Laminator, 1, Infl Cus sys LOT 9: Mach Cab, 4

LOT 5: Drill Press, WT 100 LOT 10: Drill Press, Johansson

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 1 LOT 2 LOT 3 LOT 4 LOT 5 LOT 6 LOT 7 LOT 8 LOT 9 LOT 10 LOT 11 LOT 12 LOT 13  

27 Don Lewis No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 127.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 Ed Xavier No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 217.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Pete Schoenberger No Bid 51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-16     LOT 14: Lift, AAL 12 ton LOT 19: Misc Granite Blocks, 4 pl LOT 24: Optic Tables, 9

Bid Opening Date: 8/10/16 LOT 15: Lift 15', Genie PLC15DC LOT 20: Withdrawn from Sale by LLNL Program LOT 25: Misc Test Equip, 12 pl

LOT 16: Lathe, La Blond Regal LOT 21: Lifts, 2, SCL 24 LOT 26: Work Benches, 3, Cabinets, 3

 10:00 am LOT 17: Man Lift, Upright LOT 22: Misc Pts Bins, 4 pl

LOT 18: PVC fittings & valves, 2 pl LOT 23: Telephones, 6 pl

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 14 LOT 15 LOT 16:  LOT 17: LOT 18: LOT 19: LOT 20: LOT 21: LOT 22: LOT 23: LOT 24  LOT 25  LOT 26

1 Guy Ruchonnet No Bid No Bid 1,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Steven Biehl No Bid 275.00 No Bid 702.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 361.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Matt Swisher No Bid No Bid 1,234.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Jeff Lee No Bid No Bid 1,315.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Arnold Hof No Bid 260.00 2,078.00 238.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 429.00 421.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 Phil Sage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Dan Sachau No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 187.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 Earl Kelly No Bid 217.63 1,253.67 No Bid 112.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid 529.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid 277.94

9 Tom Lipton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 John Patton No Bid No Bid 2,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11 Kevin Hendershott No Bid 229.00 2,055.00 229.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 20.00 No Bid 10.00 No Bid 46.00

12 Joachim Wiest 51.00 72.00 555.00 101.00 21.00 22.00 No Bid 66.00 77.00 No Bid 777.00 888.00 No Bid

13 Gary Aslin No Bid No Bid 3,211.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 111.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14 James Vidal No Bid No Bid 497.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,407.00 No Bid 6,577.00 No Bid

15 Joe Morgan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 237.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

16 Neil Porter 20.00 226.00 No Bid 375.00 25.00 No Bid No Bid 256.00 126.00 226.00 21.00 No Bid 26.00

17 Andrew Barreto No Bid No Bid 500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5,310.00 No Bid

18 Brandt Esser No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 526.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 Chris Burns No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Stan Carter 32.00 41.00 201.00 12.00 41.00 10.00 No Bid 140.00 90.00 60.00 40.00 76.00 20.00

21 Lou Ramondetta No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 300.00 No Bid

22 Michael Bercovich No Bid No Bid No Bid 400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

23 Nick St. Hilaire No Bid No Bid 1,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 Dean Felzkdwski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 200.00

25 Paul Berson No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 551.00 No Bid No Bid

26 John Schiff No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3,844.88 No Bid



SEALED BID SALE ABSTRACT

Miscellaneous Equipment

SALE NO:  SBS-16-16     LOT 14: Lift, AAL 12 ton LOT 19: Misc Granite Blocks, 4 pl LOT 24: Optic Tables, 9

Bid Opening Date: 8/10/16 LOT 15: Lift 15', Genie PLC15DC LOT 20: Withdrawn from Sale by LLNL Program LOT 25: Misc Test Equip, 12 pl

LOT 16: Lathe, La Blond Regal LOT 21: Lifts, 2, SCL 24 LOT 26: Work Benches, 3, Cabinets, 3

 10:00 am LOT 17: Man Lift, Upright LOT 22: Misc Pts Bins, 4 pl

LOT 18: PVC fittings & valves, 2 pl LOT 23: Telephones, 6 pl

 No. Bidder's Name LOT 14 LOT 15 LOT 16:  LOT 17: LOT 18: LOT 19: LOT 20: LOT 21: LOT 22: LOT 23: LOT 24  LOT 25  LOT 26

27 Don Lewis No Bid No Bid 688.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

28 Ed Xavier No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Pete Schoenberger No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

31 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received, verified all entries on this abstract from those bids and find it correct.

Sales Manager: Date:

Witness to Bid Opening: Date:


